

EXHIBIT A

**EDWARD N.CAHN, CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
THE SCO GROUP, INC., et al.
ATTORNEY SUMMARY
NOVEMBER 1, 2009 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2009**

Name of Professional	Position of the Professional, Number of Years in that Position, Year of Obtaining License to Practice, Area of Expertise	Hourly Billing Rate	Total Billed Hours	Total Compensation
Biron, T	Partner Since 1984, Member of PA Bar Since 1972, Member of NJ Bar Since 1987, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$690.00	1.00	\$690.00
Fatell, B.	Partner Since 2000, Member of PA Bar Since 1981, Member of DE Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring and Bankruptcy	\$675.00	87.50	\$59,062.50
Linney, B	Partner Since 2003, Member of NY Bar Since 1993, Member of DC Bar Since 1999, Area of Expertise - Business	\$585.00	0.70	\$409.50
Bachman, A.	Partner Since 1982, Member of PA Bar Since 1972, Area of Expertise - Business	\$680.00	0.80	\$544.00
Myers, J.	Partner Since 1992, Member of PA Bar Since 1982 Area of Expertise - Business	\$595.00	0.10	\$59.50
Pollack, M	Partner Since 1982, Member of PA Bar Since 1974, Member of NY Bar Since 2000 Area of Expertise - Financial Services	\$625.00	15.90	\$9,937.50
Kelbon, R.	Partner Since 1991 Member of PA Bar Since 1985, Area of Expertise - Bankruptcy	\$600.00	36.7	\$22,020.00
Storreo, J.	Partner Since 1999 Member of PA Bar Since 1986, Area of Expertise - Public Companies	\$625.00	5.9	\$3,687.50
Gruszecki, W	Of Counsel - Member of PA Bar Since 1979, Area of Expertise - Business	\$390.00	2.0	\$780.00
Guilfoyle, V.	Associate, Member of DE Bar Since 2008, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring	\$255.00	0.40	\$102.00
Reberts Allen, T.	Associate, Member of PA Bar Since 2007, Area of Expertise - Business	\$275.00	7.3	\$2,007.50
Tarr, S.	Associate, Member of NY Bar Since 2005, Area of Expertise - Business Restructuring	\$410.00	66.20	\$27,142.00
Senese, K.	Paralegal (Since 1993)	\$235.00	3.70	\$869.50
Kowalczyk, M.	Paralegal (Since 2001)	\$230.00	0.60	\$138.00
Moody, T.	Paralegal (Since 1996)	\$210.00	5.10	\$1,071.00
Root, A.	Law Clerk	\$260.00	15.7	\$4,082.00
Grand Total:			249.60	\$132,602.50

**EDWARD N.CAHN, CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
THE SCO GROUP, INC., et al.
PROJECT CODE SUMMARY
NOVEMBER 1, 2009 TO NOVEMBER 30, 2009**

PROJECT CODE	PROJECT CATEGORY	TOTAL HOURS	TOTAL FEES
1	Chapter 11 Trustee Specific Matters	0.3	\$123.00
2	Blank Rome Fee / Employment Applications	8.9	\$3,649.00
3	Other Professionals' Fee / Employment Issues	8.4	\$3,959.00
4	Debtors' Business Operations	68.2	\$34,997.00
5	Case Administration	11.0	\$3,680.00
6	IP Licensing	65.4	\$37,796.50
7	Executory Contracts and Unexpired Leases	21.4	\$13,260.00
8	Claims Analysis and Objections	0.0	\$0.00
9	Employee Benefits / General Labor	0.8	\$541.00
10	Plan & Disclosure Statement	0.0	\$0.00
11	Sale of Assets / Asset Purchase Agreement	11.8	\$6,162.00
12	Stay Relief Issues	39.5	\$21,442.50
13	Tax Issues	0.0	\$0.00
14	Asset Analysis and Recovery	0.0	\$0.00
15	Hearings - Attendance / Preparation	11.4	\$5,835.00
16	Non-Working Travel	2.5	\$1,157.50
	TOTALS	249.6	\$132,602.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE:	01		
Nov 04 09	ATTEND TO TRUSTEE BONDING PAYMENT MATTER	TARR	0.30
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	01	TOTAL VALUE:	\$123.00
			0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 02			
Nov 17 09	REVIEW TIME RECORDS, DRAFT FEE APPLICATION AND EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING SAME (6.0)	TARR	6.00
Nov 18 09	CONTINUE DRAFTING FEE APPLICATION	TARR	2.50
Nov 24 09	CONFER WITH B. FATELL (0.2), OPA (0.2) REGARDING RESPECTIVE FEE APPLICATIONS	TARR	0.40
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 02		TOTAL VALUE: \$3,649.00	8.90

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 03			
Nov 01 09	EMAIL R KELBON REGARDING RETENTION OF PROFESSIONALS	FATELL	0.10
Nov 03 09	EMAIL REGARDING MODIFICATION TO MOTION TO AMEND BOIES SCHILLER RETENTION	FATELL	0.10
Nov 04 09	REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT AGREEMENT ON CONTINGENCY FEE ARRANGEMENT	FATELL	0.40
Nov 04 09	MONITOR EMAILS WITH BERGER SINGERMAN REGARDING FEES	FATELL	0.10
Nov 09 09	REVIEW RESPONSE OF A. SPECTER REGARDING FEES	FATELL	0.10
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONE CONVERSATION AND FOLLOW UP E-MAIL WITH K. GRUSHKA REGARDING SCOPE OF OPA'S EMPLOYMENT	ROOT	0.10
Nov 13 09	EMAILS REGARDING BERGER SINGERMAN FEES, OTHER PROFESSIONAL FEES	FATELL	0.20
Nov 18 09	REVIEW AND REVISE DRAFT ORDER FROM A. SPECTOR REGARDING BERGER SINGERMAN MOTION REGARDING FEES	FATELL	0.40
Nov 18 09	TELECONFERENCE A. SPECTOR REGARDING FEES AND CONFIRMING EMAIL	FATELL	0.30
Nov 20 09	REVIEW CNO REGARDING BOIES SCHILLER AND BERGER SINGERMAN ORDERS	FATELL	0.20
Nov 20 09	DRAFT COC REGARDING BERGER SINGERMAN MOTION	TARR	0.30
Nov 23 09	ATTEND TO COC FILING FOR BERGER SINGERMAN ORDER	TARR	0.30
Nov 24 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH P. HUNT REGARDING COUNSEL FOR R. YARROW	FATELL	0.10
Nov 24 09	RESEARCH HATCH RETENTION APPLICATION AND BEGIN DRAFTING	TARR	1.50
Nov 25 09	EMAILS WITH R. KELBON REGARDING HATCH APPLICATION	TARR	0.20
Nov 30 09	CONTINUE DRAFT HATCH RETENTION APPLICATION	TARR	4.00
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	03	TOTAL VALUE:	\$3,959.00
			8.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 04			
Nov 01 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING REVIEW BOARD OF DIRECTORS MINUTES	FATELL	0.40
Nov 01 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING ITEMS OF IMPORT IN CORPORATE MINUTES (.6); AND REVIEW EMAIL REGARDING SAME (.2)	FATELL	0.80
Nov 01 09	FURTHER REVIEW OF MINUTES OF BOARD OF DIRECTORS FROM 2006 AND PREPARE EMAIL HIGHLIGHTED ISSUES AND QUESTIONS	KELBON	3.00
Nov 02 09	EMAIL M. WEISS REGARDING POSSIBLE ACQUISITION OR LOAN	FATELL	0.20
Nov 02 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	0.20
Nov 02 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH E. CAHN REGARDING PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	0.40
Nov 03 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING CORPORATE GOVERNANCE ISSUES	FATELL	0.20
Nov 04 09	REVIEW DRAFT AGREEMENT WITH K. MCBRIDE AND EMAIL COMMENTS TO S. SINGER	FATELL	0.20
Nov 04 09	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS	FATELL	0.10
Nov 04 09	REVIEW CALENDAR FOR SCO	FATELL	0.10
Nov 04 09	REVIEW AGREEMENT; CONFERENCE WITH T. ALLEN	STORERO	0.60
Nov 04 09	DATABASE SEARCHES FOR CORPORATE INFORMATION; REVIEW WITH R. KELBON; ORDER CALIFORNIA STATUS CERTIFICATE	KOWALCZYK	0.60
Nov 04 09	REVIEW ALL STOCK OPTION PLANS, FORM GRANT NOTICES AND STOCK OPTION AGREEMENTS; DRAFT SUMMARY OF RELEVANT TERMS OF THE PLANS; REVIEW MINUTES APPROVING EXTENSION OF THE OPTIONS' TERMS	ROBERTS AL	2.40
Nov 04 09	EMAIL A. ROOT REGARDING RESEARCH ISSUES	TARR	0.30
Nov 05 09	CONFERENCE WITH T. ALLEN; REVIEW AGREEMENT	STORERO	0.30
Nov 05 09	UPDATE SUMMARY TABLE OF INCENTIVE PLANS	ROBERTS AL	0.30
Nov 06 09	EMAIL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING RESPONSES TO INQUIRY FROM POTENTIAL LENDER	FATELL	0.10
Nov 06 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING J. HUNSACKER DEPARTURE	FATELL	0.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON AND S. TARR REGARDING PENDING MATTER AND STRATEGY TO RESPOND TO VARIOUS PLEADINGS	FATELL	1.00
Nov 09 09	CONFERENCE WITH S. TARR REGARDING STRATEGY	FATELL	0.30
Nov 09 09	REVIEW EMAIL MEMO TO OPA AND TRUSTEE FROM EMPLOYEE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 09 09	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE AND REVIEW 8-K REGARDING JEFF HUNSAKER RESIGNATION	FATELL	0.40
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH M. FISLER REGARDING FINANCING TERM SHEET	FATELL	0.20
Nov 09 09	REVIEW AND EDIT FINANCING TERM SHEET AND DISCUSS WITH M. FISLER	FATELL	0.40
Nov 09 09	EMAILS REGARDING EUROPEAN SALES	FATELL	0.20
Nov 09 09	EMAIL REGARDING J. HUNSAKER RESIGNATION	FATELL	0.10
Nov 09 09	REVIEW FORM 8-K; RESPOND TO QUESTIONS; REVIEW DOCUMENT; CONFERENCE WITH T. ALLEN	STORERO	0.30
Nov 09 09	CIRCULATE UPDATED SUMMARY OF SCO'S INCENTIVE PLAN	ROBERTS AL	0.30
Nov 10 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO REGARDING CORPORATE ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Nov 10 09	MEETING WITH R. KELBON REGARDING VARIOUS PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	0.80
Nov 10 09	MEET WITH B. FATELL AND S. TARR TO REVIEW CHECK LIST OF TO DO ITEMS ON VARIOUS ITEMS	KELBON	0.80
Nov 10 09	WORK ON ISSUES RELATED TO STOCK OPTION GRANTS ETC	KELBON	1.00
Nov 10 09	CONFER WITH S. TARR REGARDING MISCELLANEOUS ISSUES	KELBON	0.20
Nov 10 09	REVIEW ISSUES WITH S. TARR REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES, STOCK OPTIONS, ETC.	KELBON	0.40
Nov 10 09	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL AND R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS; CONFERENCE WITH T. ALLEN; EMAIL REGARDING RELEASE	STORERO	0.80
Nov 10 09	TELEPHONE CONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO	ROBERTS AL	0.10
Nov 11 09	CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON, B. FATELL, OPA	TARR	1.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	REGARDING STATUS OF CASES (1.0);		
Nov 12 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 12 09	TEAM CALL WITH TRUSTEE, PROFESSIONALS AND OPA REGARDING MULTIPLE OPEN ISSUES	FATELL	1.30
Nov 12 09	EMAIL FROM B. COMER REGARDING VARIOUS OPEN ISSUES	FATELL	0.10
Nov 12 09	EMAILS REGARDING J. HUNSACKER DEPARTURE	FATELL	0.10
Nov 12 09	REVIEW 8-K REGARDING HUNSACKER EMPLOYMENT AND EMAILS REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.20
Nov 12 09	CONFER WITH J. STORERO ON STOCK OPTION PLANS AND CHANGES AND ISSUES RELATED THERETO (.2); MESSAGES TO J. MEYERS ON EMPLOYMENT LAW ISSUES AND STOCK OPTION PLANS (.1); CONFER WITH T. BIRON ON STOCK OPTION ISSUES AND BANKRUPTCY QUESTIONS (.4); CONFER WITH B. FATELL ON ISSUES BEING RESEARCHED AND ANALYZED (.2); GUIDANCE TO A. ROOT ON RESEARCH ISSUES AND STOCK OPTIONS IN BANKRUPTCY (.2); EMAIL TO A. ROOT ON ADDITIONAL ISSUES TO RESEARCH ON STOCK OPTIONS IN BANKRUPTCY (.2); CONFER WITH A. SPECTOR ON CHAPTER 11 ISSUES RELATED TO STOCK OPTIONS (.1);	KELBON	1.40
Nov 12 09	TEAM CALL (PARTICIPATE PART OF TIME) ON MULTIPLE ISSUES; AND FOLLOW UP FROM CALL	KELBON	0.80
Nov 12 09	RECEIVE GUIDANCE FROM R. KELBON REGARDING RESEARCH ON STOCK OPTION ISSUES (.10); PERFORM SAID RESEARCH	ROOT	1.70
Nov 12 09	ATTEND TELECONFERENCE WITH OPA, B. FATELL REGARDING STATUS	TARR	1.00
Nov 13 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING UPDATE ON VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	0.40
Nov 13 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 13 09	REVIEW 8-K AND APPROVE	FATELL	0.10
Nov 13 09	EMAIL FROM J. MYERS ON STOCK OPTION AND EMPLOYEE ISSUES; EMAILS TO AND FROM J. STORERO REGARDING SAME; CONFER WITH KEN NIELSON TO REVIEW COMPANY POLICY AND HISTORY OF THE STOCK OPTION; CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING VARIOUS ISSUES RAISED; REVIEW EMAIL FROM NEILSON	KELBON	1.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Nov 13 09	WORK ON STOCK OPTION RESEARCH ISSUES AND ANALYSIS; CONFER WITH T. BIRON ON ABILITY OF TRUSTEE TO ISSUE STOCK OPTIONS, ETC.	KELBON	1.20
Nov 13 09	REVIEW WAGE/STOCK ISSUE	MYERS	0.10
Nov 13 09	CONFERENCE REGARDING OPTION	STORERO	0.60
Nov 13 09	CONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO TO DISCUSS ADDITIONAL RESEARCH	ROBERTS AL	0.20
Nov 13 09	CONTINUE TO RESEARCH STOCK OPTION ISSUES (2.70); RESPOND TO EMAILS REGARDING MONTHLY OPERATING REPORTS (.30)	ROOT	3.00
Nov 16 09	CONTINUE TO RESEARCH STOCK OPTION ISSUES	ROOT	2.00
Nov 17 09	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 17 09	CONTINUE TO RESEARCH STOCK OPTION ISSUES	ROOT	1.80
Nov 18 09	REVIEW MATERIALS FOR CALL	FATELL	0.40
Nov 18 09	TEAM CONFERENCE CALL WITH OPA AND S. TARR	FATELL	1.10
Nov 18 09	REVIEW NOTES FROM OPA CALL FOR FOLLOW UP	FATELL	0.10
Nov 18 09	MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING PENDING MATTERS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 18 09	RESPOND TO EMAILS	STORERO	0.30
Nov 18 09	ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH OPA, B. FATELL REGARDING OPEN ISSUES	TARR	1.20
Nov 19 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING DIP LOAN	FATELL	0.20
Nov 19 09	EMAILS WITH K. NEILSEN REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 19 09	REVIEW RESEARCH SUMMARY REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS (.2); DISCUSS WITH S. TARR (.1); REVIEW K. NIELSON EMAIL AND RELATED DOCUMENTS REGARDING STOCK OPTIONS (.3)	FATELL	0.60
Nov 19 09	UPDATE WITH S. TARR ON OPA AND TEAM CALL FROM YESTERDAY, OPEN ISSUES; STOCK OPTION REVIEW ISSUES AND CONFERENCE IN J. STORERO FOR PART OF TIME	KELBON	0.30
Nov 19 09	REVIEW DOCUMENTS; RESPOND TO EMAILS; CONFERENCE WITH T. ALLEN REGARDING ISSUES; EMAIL R. KELBON AND B. FATELL	STORERO	1.20
Nov 19 09	RESEARCH ADDITIONAL QUESTIONS RAISED REGARDING	ROBERTS AL	3.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	OPTIONS; CONFERENCE WITH J. STORERO;		
Nov 19 09	CONFER WITH R. KELBON REGARDING OPEN ITEMS, INCLUDING STOCK OPTIONS ISSUE	TARR	0.30
Nov 20 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE CAHN REGARDING HEARING AND STATUS OF MOTIONS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 20 09	REVIEW AND REPLY TO R. TIBBITTS EMAIL REGARDING PUBLIC DISCLOSURES AND SEC REQUIREMENTS	FATELL	0.10
Nov 20 09	REVIEW AND REPLY TO EMAIL REGARDING LEASE IN GERMANY FOR SUB	FATELL	0.20
Nov 20 09	UPDATE OPTION CHART BASED ON ADDITIONAL RESEARCH	ROBERTS AL	1.00
Nov 23 09	REVIEW DETAILED DISTRIBUTION AGREEMENT FOR HONG KONG COMPANY AND PROVIDE COMMENTS	FATELL	0.80
Nov 23 09	REVIEW AND RESPOND TO PROPOSED REVISIONS TO NDA WITH POSSIBLE LENDER	FATELL	0.30
Nov 23 09	REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING HONG KONG BUSINESS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 23 09	CONFER WITH B. FATELL ON UPDATE FROM HEARING AND MATTERS TAKEN UNDER ADVISEMENT	KELBON	0.50
Nov 23 09	REVIEW OPTION MATERIALS	STORERO	0.30
Nov 23 09	REVIEW OPA GRID/ISSUES LIST (0.3); REVIEW DOCUMENTS REGARDING STOCK OPTION GRANTS AND P RIOR ORDER REGARDING SAME (0.6); EMAILS WITH OPA REGARDING ASSETS SALE(S) (0.3)	TARR	1.00
Nov 24 09	MEETING TO DISCUSS PRESENT STATUS OF STOCK OPTIONS AND HOW TO RESTRUCTURE PLAN	FATELL	1.50
Nov 24 09	REVIEW NOTES AND TASK LIST FROM OPA AND PREPARE FOR STATUS CALL WITH TRUSTEE CAHN	FATELL	0.40
Nov 24 09	R. KELBON AND TRUSTEE CAHN REGARDING STATUS OF VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	0.70
Nov 24 09	REVIEW NEWS ARTICLE REGARDING SCO	FATELL	0.30
Nov 24 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH P. HUNT REGARDING DEBTOR FINANCING FROM R. YARROW	FATELL	0.20
Nov 24 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH B. COMER REGARDING LEASE ISSUES AND VARIOUS OPERATIONAL ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Nov 24 09	UPDATE FROM B. FATELL ON ISSUES RELATED TO STOCK OPTIONS, AND OTHER MOTIONS IN CASE FOR	KELBON	0.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	DECEMBER		
Nov 24 09	MEETING WITH J. STORERO AND B. FATELL AND S.TARR TO REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO STOCK OPTION EXTENSIONS AND ISSUANCE AND REPRICING ISSUES	KELBON	1.50
Nov 24 09	REVIEW MEMO AND DOCUMENTS REGARDING 409A; CONFERENCE WITH W. GRUSZECKI; TELEPHONE CALL TO J. STORERO	BACHMAN	0.60
Nov 24 09	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL AND R. KELBON REGARDING OPTIONS; REVIEW DOCUMENTS	STORERO	1.50
Nov 24 09	REVIEW E-MAIL FORWARDED TO A. BACHMAN WITH REGARD TO OPTIONS; REVIEW ATTACHMENT; FORMULATE PRELIMINARY OBSERVATIONS	GRUSZECKI	0.90
Nov 24 09	REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTATION WITH REGARD TO THE SCO GROUP INC. OMNIBUS STOCK INCENTIVE PLAN	GRUSZECKI	0.90
Nov 24 09	CONFERENCE WITH A. BACHMAN WITH REGARD TO THE QUESTIONS RAISED WITH REGARD TO OPTION PLAN	GRUSZECKI	0.20
Nov 24 09	REVIEW LIQUIDITY REPORT (0.3); CONFER WITH SCO, CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE'S OFFICE REGARDING SIGNATURE CARDS (0.3);	TARR	0.60
Nov 24 09	REVIEW PRIOR STOCK OPTION MOTION AND EMAIL B. FATELL, R. KELBON REGARDING SAME (0.5); ATTEND CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. FATELL, R. KELBON, J. STORERO REGARDING SAME (1.5)	TARR	2.00
Nov 25 09	REIEW EMAILS FROM B. COMER ON OPERATIONS AND ISSUES RELATED THERETO; CONFER WITH B.FATELL ON LEASE ISSUES; EMAIL FROM S. TARR ON STAY RELIEF DENIAL	KELBON	0.30
Nov 25 09	REVIEW OPERATING REPORTS	KELBON	0.50
Nov 25 09	EMAIL TO AND FROM RYAN TIBBETTS ON AUTOZONE ORDER AND EMAIL ON GRAY ORDER	KELBON	0.10
Nov 25 09	ATTEND TO SIGNATURE CARDS WITH TRUSTEE'S ASSISTANT AND SCO (0.3); REVIEW FORM ASSET SALE MOTION AND CONFER WITH A. ROOT REGARDING SAME (0.4)	TARR	0.70
Nov 30 09	CONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON AND S. TARR TO REVIEW STATUS OF VARIOUS MATTERS	FATELL	0.80
Nov 30 09	REVIEW A. PETROFSKY DETAILED EMAIL AND REFERENCED RULES	FATELL	0.40
Nov 30 09	COMPARE OPERATING REPORTS AND OUTLINE COMMENTS	KELBON	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Nov 30 09	CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. FATELL TO REVIEW OPEN ITEMS AND ISSUES EMAILS FROM SHAREHOLDER	KELBON	0.80
Nov 30 09	ATTEND MEETING WITH B. FATELL, R. KELBON REGARDING OPEN ITEMS	TARR	0.80
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 04		TOTAL VALUE: \$34,997.00	68.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 05			
Nov 09 09	CONFER WITH B. FATELL ON CASE ADMINISTRATION ISSUES	KELBON	0.20
Nov 09 09	GUIDANCE TO A. ROOT ON REVIEW ISSUES RELATED TO CASE ADMINISTRATION	KELBON	0.10
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONIC MEETING WITH B. FATELL AND S. TARR ON DEADLINES FOR UPCOMING MOTIONS AND RESPONSES AND DRAFT ANSWERS AND POSITIONS OF THE TRUSTEE	KELBON	1.00
Nov 09 09	CREATE ONGOING CALENDAR REFLECTING CRITICAL DATES AND EVENTS (1.7); TELEPHONE DISCUSSION WITH S. TARR REGARDING STATUS OF CALENDAR (.10)	ROOT	1.80
Nov 09 09	CONFER WITH A. ROOT REGARDING TO-DO LIST	TARR	0.20
Nov 10 09	RECEIVE GUIDANCE FROM S. TARR REGARDING CASE CALENDAR (.10); UPDATE CASE CALENDAR TO REFLECT COMMENTS FROM S. TARR (.20)	ROOT	0.30
Nov 10 09	REVIEW OF TO-DO LIST AND CONFER WITH A. ROOT REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.30
Nov 11 09	EMAIL EXCHANGE WITH S. TARR; DRAFT NOTICE OF CHANGE OF OMNIBUS HEARING DATE / TIME; FORWARD TO B. FATELL AND S. TARR FOR REVIEW AND EFILING APPROVAL; REVIEW CURRENT DOCKET, UPDATE 2002 SERVICE LIST AND PREPARE FOR SERVICE OF NOTICE	SENESE	0.30
Nov 12 09	REVIEW CNO'S FILED FOR PENDING MOTIONS	FATELL	0.10
Nov 12 09	FORMAT AND EFILE NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED OMNIBUS HEARING; SERVICE OF NOTICE UPON ALL PARTIES LISTED ON THE 2002 SERVICE LIST VIA OVERNIGHT MAIL OR FIRST CLASS MAIL	SENESE	0.70
Nov 12 09	REVIEW CURRENT DOCKET TO CONFIRM NO OBJECTIONS FILED; DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION WITH RESPECT TO TRUSTEE'S MOTION TO MODIFY RETENTION ORDER OF BOIES SCHILLER; FORWARD TO S. TARR AND B. FATELL FOR REVIEW AND EFILING APPROVAL	SENESE	0.40
Nov 12 09	REVIEW CURRENT DOCKET; DRAFT CERTIFICATES OF NO OBJECTION WITH RESPECT TO (I) TRUSTEE'S 9019 MOTION WITH AUTOZONE AND (II) RELATED MOTION TO FILE EXHIBIT UNDER SEAL; FORWARD TO S. TARR AND B. FATELL FOR REVIEW; TELEPHONE FROM S. TARR ADVISING OF EXTENDED DEADLINE FOR CERTAIN PARTIES BY B. FATELL	SENESE	0.60
Nov 12 09	ATTEND TO NOTICE OF RESCHEDULED HEARING	TARR	0.30
Nov 13 09	CITE CHECK CASES REFERENCED IN TRUSTEE'S	SENESE	0.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	OBJECTION TO W. GRAY MOTION FOR RELIEF; REVIEW NOTICE OF MOTION AND DRAFT CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE / SERVICE LIST AND PREPARE FOR SERVICE		
Nov 13 09	FORMAT AND EFILE TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION (WITH EXHIBIT DOCUMENTATION) TO W. GRAY'S MOTION FOR RELIEF; SERVICE OF SAME UPON INTERESTED PARTIES VIA EMAIL AND SERVICE UPON ALL PARTIES LISTED ON THE 2002 SERVICE LIST VIA FIRST CLASS MAIL	SENESE	0.50
Nov 16 09	REVIEW DOCKET TO MONITOR CASE	FATELL	0.10
Nov 17 09	REVIEW CURRENT DOCKET TO CONFIRM NO OBJECTIONS FILED IN CONNECTION BOIES SCHILLER RETENTION MODIFICATION MOTION; FINALIZE CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE WITH RESPECT TO SERVICE OF MOTION TO MODIFY BOIES SCHILLER RETENTION ORDER; EFILE SAME; REVISE, FINALIZE, FORMAT AND EFILE CERTIFICATE OF NO OBJECTION WITH RESPECT TO SAME MOTION; PREPARE CNO BINDER / OVERSEE DELIVERY OF SAME TO CHAMBERS	SENESE	0.40
Nov 18 09	ATTEND TO AGENDA AND OTHER MATTERS RELATED TO 11/20 HEARING	TARR	1.00
Nov 20 09	REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE ORDER MODIFYING BOIES SCHILLER RETENTION ORDER	SENESE	0.10
Nov 20 09	PREPARE PROPOSED FORM OF ORDERS FOR 11/20/09 HEARING	MOODY	0.50
Nov 23 09	SCAN, EFILE AND COORIDNATE HAND DELIVERY OF CERTIFICATION OF COUNSEL REGARDING MOTION FOR ORDER AMENDING ADMINISTRATIVE ORDER ESTABLISHING PROCEDURES FOR INTERIM MONTHLY COMPENSATION FOR PROFESSIONALS	MOODY	0.40
Nov 23 09	UPDATE CASE CALENDAR STATUS AND CONFER WITH AND EMAIL A. ROOT, T. GUILFOYLE RE DRAFTING MOTIONS (0.8); MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH BLANK ROME TEAM RE FILING DATES (0.3)	TARR	1.10
Nov 24 09	RETURN CALL TO DAVE OF 4FRONT TECHNOLOGIES, CREDITOR, REQUESTING ADDRESS CHANGE; UPDATE 2002 SERVICE INFORMATION FOR SAME	MOODY	0.20
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 05	TOTAL VALUE:	\$3,680.00	11.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 06			
Nov 01 09	STUDY 10TH CIRCUIT OPINION	FATELL	0.70
Nov 02 09	CONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS, S. SINGER AND TRUSTEE	FATELL	0.50
Nov 02 09	RESEARCH EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE REGARDING IBM MEETING	FATELL	0.20
Nov 02 09	MEETING WITH R. LEVIN REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS	FATELL	0.50
Nov 02 09	REVIEW STIPULATION FILED IN AUTO ZONE STATE COURT PROCEEDING	FATELL	0.20
Nov 02 09	CONFER WITH B. FATELL ON MEETINGS WITH IBM AND NOVELL	KELBON	0.10
Nov 02 09	ANALYSIS OF NOVELL ISSUES AND EMAILS TO R. TIBBITTS REGARDING SAME	TARR	2.80
Nov 03 09	REVIEW LANGUAGE IN 10TH CIRCUIT OPINION AND DETAILED EMAIL REGARDING SCO PROPERTY TO TRANSFER IN SALE	FATELL	0.30
Nov 03 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. LEVIN REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS (2 CALLS)	FATELL	0.30
Nov 03 09	DETAILED EMAIL REGARDING SVRX LICENSES	FATELL	0.30
Nov 03 09	EMAIL A. LEWIS REGARDING SUSE ARBITRATION	FATELL	0.10
Nov 03 09	EMAILS WITH A. LEWIS REGARDING SUSE ARBITRATION	FATELL	0.20
Nov 03 09	REVIEW RESEARCH MEMORANDUM ON LICENSES AND ASSUMPTION	KELBON	0.50
Nov 03 09	WORK ON ANALYSIS OF LICENSE TRANSFERS	KELBON	2.00
Nov 04 09	SCAN REVIEW R. TIBBITTS REPORT ON SUSE ARBITRATION ISSUES	FATELL	0.20
Nov 04 09	CONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS, S. TARR AND R. KELBON REGARDING SVRX LICENSE ISSUES	FATELL	2.00
Nov 04 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH S. SINGER REGARDING IP LITIGATION (AND T. NORMAND FOR PART OF CALL)	FATELL	0.50
Nov 04 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. LEVIN (2 CALLS) REGARDING SETTLEMENT DISCUSSIONS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 04 09	REVIEW ZURICH ARBITRATION NOTICE; EMAIL TO A. LEWIS REGARDING NOVELL REQUEST FOR CONSENT TO STAY RELIEF	FATELL	0.20

.Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Nov 04 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATION STRATEGY	FATELL	0.30
Nov 04 09	REPORTS ON APA ANALYSIS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 04 09	RESEARCH WHETHER CERTAIN PROVISIONS IN ASSET PURCHASE AGREEMENT MAKE IT AN EXECUTORY CONTRACT (2.0); PROVIDE SUMMARY OF RESEARCH AND RECOMMENDATIONS TO S. TARR AND R. KELBON (.60)	ROOT	2.60
Nov 04 09	RESEARCH REGARDING NOVELL ISSUE (0.6); CONFER WITH R. TIBBITTS, R. KELBON REGARDING LITIGATION ISSUES (3.0)	TARR	3.60
Nov 05 09	EMAIL R. LEVIN REGARDING MEETING	FATELL	0.10
Nov 05 09	EMAIL T. NORMAND REGARDING AUTOZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.10
Nov 05 09	EMAILS REGARDING AUTOZONE	FATELL	0.10
Nov 05 09	EMAILS REGARDING SETTLEMENT MEETING	FATELL	0.10
Nov 05 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH D. STEWART, T. NORMAND REGARDING AUTOZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Nov 05 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING SETTLEMENT STRATEGY	FATELL	0.20
Nov 05 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING LITIGATION AND SETTLEMENT ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Nov 05 09	REVIEW PROTECTIVE ORDER AND EMAIL TO R. LEVIN	FATELL	0.40
Nov 05 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON REGARDING LITIGATION AND SETTLEMENT ISSUES	FATELL	0.40
Nov 05 09	REVIEW MEMOS ON MOFO LETTER REGARDING APA AND LICENSES	FATELL	0.30
Nov 05 09	EMAILS WITH R. LEVIN AND NOVELL REGARDING SETTLEMENT MEETING	FATELL	0.20
Nov 05 09	EMAIL TO A. LEWIS REGARDING STAY RELIEF FOR SUSE ARBITRATION	FATELL	0.10
Nov 05 09	REVIEW M. GONZALEZ DETAILED MEMO ON APA AND INTENT OF PARTIES	FATELL	0.30
Nov 05 09	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE TO R. LEVIN REGARDING TRUSTEE'S MOTION TO SEAL AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT (.2); EMAIL REGARDING SAME TO A. LEWIS (.1)	FATELL	0.30
Nov 05 09	REPORT FROM R. TIBBITTS ON INTENT OF APA	FATELL	0.10

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Nov 05 09	REVIEW A. ROOT EMAIL MEMO REGARDING NOVELL ISSUES (0.2), REVIEW CASES REGARDING SAME (0.8), AND MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH R. KELBON REGARDING SAME (0.6); RESEARCH NOVELL ISSUES (1.0)	TARR	2.60
Nov 06 09	TEAM MEETING REGARDING SETTLEMENT STRATEGY	FATELL	1.80
Nov 06 09	REVIEW INFORMATION AND DOCUMENTS FROM R. TIBBITS REGARDING TRANSFER OF COPYRIGHTS	FATELL	0.50
Nov 06 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. KELBON AND S. TARR REGARDING PREPARATION FOR SETTLEMENT MEETING	FATELL	0.40
Nov 06 09	MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH R. LEVIN REGARDING PROTECTIVE ORDER	FATELL	0.30
Nov 06 09	LITIGATION STRATEGY CONFERENCE CALL	KELBON	1.80
Nov 06 09	EMAIL J. KESSLER RE NOVELL/IBM RESEARCH (0.2);	TARR	0.20
Nov 06 09	ATTEND STATUS/STRATEGY CONFERENCE CALL WITH B. FATELL	TARR	1.00
Nov 09 09	REVIEW DRAFT TRUSTEE OUTLINE FOR SETTLEMENT MEETING AND EMAIL COMMENTS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING STRATEGY FOR SETTLEMENT MEETING	FATELL	0.40
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH J. MCMAHON REGARDING MOTION TO SEAL SETTLEMENT WITH AUTOZONE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING TRADEMARK ISSUE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 09 09	EMAILS TO COUNSEL FOR IBM AND NOVELL REGARDING AUTOZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Nov 09 09	REVIEW ADDITIONAL DOCUMENTS REGARDING DEFENSES TO NOVELL THEORY ON SALE	KELBON	1.10
Nov 09 09	MEETING WITH T. BIRON TO DISCUSS ISSUES RAISED BY MOFO ON ASSUMPTION AND ASSIGNMENT, ETC.	KELBON	0.90
Nov 09 09	RESEARCH CASE LAW ON FILING SETTLEMENTS UNDER SEAL AND PROVIDE RESULTS OF RESEARCH TO B. FATELL (.20)	ROOT	0.20
Nov 10 09	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH UST, REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.10
Nov 10 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH J. MCMAHON AND DETAILED	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	EMAIL REGARDING MOTION TO FILE UNDER SEAL		
Nov 10 09	ATTEND MEETING WITH TRUSTEE AND LITIGATION TEAM TO PREPARE FOR SETTLEMENT MEETING WITH NOVELL AND IBM	FATELL	2.20
Nov 10 09	DETAILED EMAIL TO M. JACOBS, COUNSEL TO NOVELL REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Nov 10 09	MEETING WITH LITIGATION TEAM TO STRATEGIZE OVER SETTLEMENT MEETING	KELBON	3.00
Nov 10 09	ATTEND MEETING REGARDING SAME (3.1); REVIEW IBM/NOVELL MARKETING INFO (0.5);	TARR	3.60
Nov 11 09	NEGOTIATION MEETING WITH REPRESENTATIVES FROM IBM AND NOVELL, FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS WITH SCO TEAM	FATELL	5.50
Nov 11 09	MEETING WITH R. KELBON AND S. TARR REGARDING STRATEGY ON SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.80
Nov 11 09	PREPARE FOR AND ATTEND SETTLEMENT NEGOTIATIONS WITH IBM AND NOVELL AND FOLLOW UP WITH LITIGATION TEAM	KELBON	5.50
Nov 12 09	REVIEW COURT OPINION REGARDING FILING SETTLEMENTS UNDER SEAL, AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT PAPERS AND OUTLINE ARGUMENT TO SUPPORT SEAL MOTION	FATELL	1.00
Nov 12 09	EMAIL COUNSEL TO IBM AND NOVELL REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Nov 12 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH J. MCMAHON REGARDING SEAL MOTION REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Nov 16 09	EMAIL M. JACOBS REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.10
Nov 16 09	EMAIL J. MCMAHON REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.10
Nov 17 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH J. MCMAHON REGARDING SEAL MOTION ON AUTO ZONE AND DISCUSS WITH T. NORMAND	FATELL	0.50
Nov 17 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH D. STEWART, COUNSEL FOR AUTO ZONE	FATELL	0.30
Nov 18 09	REVIEW DRAFT DECLARATION OF TRUSTEE E. CAHN REGARDING DISTRICT OF UTAH LITIGATION, REVISE AND EMAIL J. NORMAND	FATELL	0.40
Nov 18 09	EMAIL D. STEWART REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.10
Nov 18 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH D. STEWART AND J. NORMAND	FATELL	0.30

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT		
Nov 19 09	REVIEW LICENSE AGREEMENT WITH IBM REGARDING CERTAIN SOFTWARE	FATELL	0.30
Nov 19 09	REVIEW NOVELL MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE RELATED PROCEEDINGS, REVIEW AND EDIT DRAFT SCO REPLY	FATELL	1.00
Nov 20 09	TELECONFERENCE AND EMAIL WITH T. ORMAND REGARDING DOCKET AND PLEADINGS IN 10TH CIRCUIT	FATELL	0.20
Nov 20 09	EMAILS WITH D. STEWART REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT	FATELL	0.20
Nov 20 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. MCMAHON REGARDING AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT, DISCUSSIONS WITH D. STEWART REGARDING SAME, PREPARE DRAFT ORDERS	FATELL	0.40
Nov 20 09	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING UNIX TRADEMARK	FATELL	0.30
Nov 20 09	DRAFT ORDER REGARDING SEAL MOTION AFTER CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL (0.3), REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF US TRUSTEE EMAILS REGARDING SAME (0.3), AND DRAFT COC FOR AZ SEAL MOTION (0.3)	TARR	0.90
Nov 23 09	REVIEW AND REVISE OBJECTION TO CONSOLIDATION OF TRIALS IN UTAH	FATELL	0.40
Nov 23 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH S. TARR REGARDING SUSE ARBITRATION AND STAY RELIEF; EMAIL M. JACOBS REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.30
Nov 23 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH T. NORMAND REGARDING OBJECTION TO CONSOLIDATION	FATELL	0.10
Nov 23 09	REVIEW FURTHER DRAFT OF OBJECTION TO UTAH ACTION	FATELL	0.20
Nov 23 09	EMAILS TO B. FATELL REGARDING AUTOZONE COC	TARR	0.20
Nov 24 09	CONFERENCE CALL WITH TRUSTEE TO REVIEW OPEN ISSUES AND UPDATE AND DISCUSS 11TH CIRCUIT RULING IN XOPEN	KELBON	0.90
Nov 25 09	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING AUTOZONE STATUS	TARR	0.20
Nov 30 09	REVIEW PLEADINGS TO PREPARE FOR UTAH HEARING ON NOVELL MOTION TO CONSOLIDATE TRIALS	FATELL	1.00
Nov 30 09	EMAIL S. SINGER AND T. NORMAND REGARDING PREPARATION FOR HEARING IN UTAH ON DECEMBER 1	FATELL	0.10
Nov 30 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH TRUSTEE REGARDING UTAH HEARING	FATELL	0.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	06	TOTAL VALUE: \$37,796.50	65.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 07			
Nov 19 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. POLLACK REGARDING NEW LEASE AGREEMENT FOR COMPANY HEADQUARTERS	FATELL	0.40
Nov 19 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. FISLER REGARDING LEASE ISSUES	FATELL	0.20
Nov 19 09	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING LEASE TRANSACTION (.2); PRELIMINARY REVIEW OF E-MAIL REGARDING LEASE TRANSACTION (.5); REVIEW OF MATERIALS (1.6)	POLLACK	2.30
Nov 20 09	REVIEW M. POLLACK COMMENTS TO NEW HEADQUARTERS LEASE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 20 09	ADDITIONAL REVIEW OF LEASE DOCUMENTS; PREPARATION OF SUMMARY FOR CLIENT AND E-MAILED SAME	POLLACK	1.90
Nov 23 09	REVIEW EMAILS REGARDING NEW LEASE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 23 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH M. POLLACK REGARDING NEW LEASE FOR HEADQUARTERS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 23 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. COMER TO REVIEW POINTS (.5); REVIEW OF E-MAILS (.2); REVISIONS TO LEASE (2.5)	POLLACK	3.20
Nov 24 09	TELECONFERENCE REGARDING PARIS LEASE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 24 09	REVIEW PROPOSED MODIFICATIONS TO SLC LEASE FOR HEADQUARTERS	FATELL	0.50
Nov 24 09	FINALIZED REVISIONS TO LEASE; REVIEW OF ORIGINAL LEASE AND FIVE AMENDMENTS; PREPARATION OF RELEASE LANGUAGE; CIRCULATED REVISIONS	POLLACK	3.20
Nov 24 09	REVIEW REGUS LEASE; RELATED EMAIL EXCHANGES AND TELECONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL	LINNEY	0.20
Nov 25 09	REVIEW LEASE FOR NEW HEADQUARTERS (.5), DISCUSS ISSUES WITH M. POLLACK (.3), DRAFT SIDE LETTER (.2)	FATELL	1.00
Nov 25 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH B. LINNEY REGARDING FRENCH LEASE IN PARIS (.4); REPORT TO B. COMER ON INTERPRETATION OF LEASE (.6)	FATELL	0.60
Nov 25 09	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING CHANGES (.3); REVISIONS TO LEASE AND CIRCULATION OF SAME (.3); REVIEW OF E-MAILS (.2); ADDITIONAL CONFERENCES AND E-MAILS (.2)	POLLACK	1.00
Nov 25 09	REVIEW PARIS LEASE; RELATED EMAIL EXCHANGES AND	LINNEY	0.20

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	TELECONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL		
Nov 25 09	REVIEW PARIS LEASE; RELATED EMAIL EXCHANGES AND TELECONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL	LINNEY	0.30
Nov 30 09	EMAILS REGARDING UTAH LEASE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 30 09	CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING LEASE	POLLACK	1.50
Nov 30 09	ADDITIONAL TIME ON CONFERENCE CALL WITH LANDLORD; CONF CALL B. COMER AND B FATELL; REVISE AND SEND OUT LEASE	POLLACK	2.80
Nov 30 09	REVIEW CANOPY LEASE	GUILFOYLE	0.40
Nov 30 09	RESEARCH NJ AND UT LEASE FILINGS, REVIEW SAME AND FORWARD SAME TO B. FATELL, R. KELBON	TARR	0.60
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 07	TOTAL VALUE:	\$13,260.00	21.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 09			
Nov 04 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH E. CAHN REGARDING REPLY TO D. MCBRIDE	FATELL	0.10
Nov 05 09	REVIEW MEMO; CALL TO B. FATELL	BACHMAN	0.10
Nov 18 09	REVIEW EMAIL REGARDING EMPLOYEE BENEFITS AND DISCUSS WITH A. BACHMAN	FATELL	0.20
Nov 18 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH A. BACHMAN REGARDING 401(K)	FATELL	0.10
Nov 18 09	EMAIL B. FISLER AND. COMER REGARDING 401(K) AND CAFETERIA BENEFITS PLAN	FATELL	0.20
Nov 18 09	TELEPHONE WITH B. FATELL; REVIEW MEMO	BACHMAN	0.10
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 09	TOTAL VALUE:	\$541.00	0.80

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 11			
Nov 02 09	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING SALE TO NORRIS	FATELL	0.20
Nov 03 09	MULTIPLE EMAILS REGARDING NDA FOR PROSPECTIVE BUYER	FATELL	0.30
Nov 03 09	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH K. SPIVAK REGARDING ASSET PURCHASE	FATELL	0.20
Nov 04 09	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. TIBBETTS AND B. FATELL AND S. TARR AND TRUSTEE CAHN (PART OF TIME) TO REVIEW ISSUES IN CONNECTION WITH SALE OF UNIXS BUSINESS	KELBON	2.00
Nov 04 09	WORK ON REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF SALE OF UNIXS BUSINESS; REVIEW ISSUES WITH S. TARR; REVIEW LEGAL ISSUES RAISED BY NOVELL; ANALYSIS OF APA , AMENDMENTS AND TLA, ETC	KELBON	2.00
Nov 04 09	FOLLOW UP DISCUSSIONS WITH B. FATELL ON ISSUES AND LANGUAGE IN DOCUMENTS AND PREPETITION TRANSACTIONS	KELBON	0.30
Nov 05 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH R. KELBON REGARDING ASSET SALE	FATELL	0.50
Nov 06 09	GUIDANCE TO S. TARR ON RESEARCH ISSUES ON EXECUTORY NATURE OF CERTAIN PROVISIONS ETC.	KELBON	0.20
Nov 09 09	GUIDANCE TO R. KELBON REGARDING SALE OF INTELLECTUAL PROPERTY UNDER DISPUTED LICENSE ARRANGEMENT	BIRON	1.00
Nov 09 09	CONFERENCE CALL WITH R. TIBETTS AND S. SINGER AND T. NORMAN ON STRUCTURE OF SALE	KELBON	0.50
Nov 23 09	RECEIVE GUIDANCE FROM S. TARR REGARDING SALE OF DE MINIMIS ASSETS	ROOT	0.10
Nov 24 09	REVIEW AND DETAILED EMAIL REGARDING NDA WITH POSSIBLE BUYER	FATELL	0.30
Nov 24 09	R. KELBON REGARDING SALE OF ASSETS	FATELL	0.10
Nov 25 09	RECEIVE GUIDANCE FROM S. TARR REGARDING DE MINIMIS ASSET SALES MOTION (.10); BEGIN DRAFTING DE MINIMIS ASSET SALES MOTION (.20)	ROOT	0.30
Nov 25 09	DRAFT DE MINIMIS SALES MOTION	ROOT	0.40
Nov 30 09	CONTINUE DRAFTING DE MINIMIS ASSET SALES MOTION	ROOT	1.40
Nov 30 09	REVIEW ASSET SALE MOTION AND BEGIN REVISION	TARR	2.00

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 11		TOTAL VALUE: \$6,162.00	11.80

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 12			
Nov 03 09	TELEPHONE CALL WITH T. STEELE, ATTORNEY FOR GRAY IN LITIGATION OVER TRADEMARK	FATELL	0.50
Nov 03 09	REVIEW J. STEELE LETTER REGARDING GRAY STAY RELIEF MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Nov 03 09	SCAN GRAY STAY RELIEF MOTION AND EMAIL REPORT TO CLIENT	FATELL	0.40
Nov 04 09	DETAILED EMAIL FROM A. LEWIS REGARDING SUSE ARBITRATION	FATELL	0.20
Nov 04 09	REVIEW LETTER FROM GRAY'S COUNSEL REGARDING STAY RELIEF	FATELL	0.20
Nov 09 09	SCAN REVIEW SECTIONS OF OPINION ON GRAY SUMMARY JUDGMENT MOTION; DISCUSS WITH R. TIBBITTS	FATELL	0.70
Nov 09 09	PREPARE DETAILED REPORT ON GRAY TRADEMARK DISPUTE AND TELEPHONE CALL WITH TOM STEELE REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.50
Nov 09 09	TELEPHONE FROM B. FATELL; RETRIEVE AND FORWARD TO R. TIBBITTS A COPY OF GRAYS' MOTION FOR RELIEF (IN CONNECTION WITH FLORIDA APPEALS PROCEEDING)	SENESE	0.10
Nov 10 09	LENGTHY TELECONFERENCE WITH T. STEELE REGARDING GRAY LITIGATION	FATELL	0.80
Nov 10 09	TELEPHONE AND EMAIL FROM S. TARR; REVIEW AND DISTRIBUTE MOTION FOR RELIEF FROM STAY TO CONTINUE INTERNATIONAL ARBITRATION, DECLARATION IN SUPPORT THEREOF AND RELATED MOTION TO FILE UNDER SEAL	SENESE	0.20
Nov 11 09	EMAIL CORRESPONDENCE WITH T. STEELE REGARDING OBJECTION TO 362 MOTION	FATELL	0.10
Nov 11 09	MEETING WITH S. TARR REGARDING GRAY STAY RELIEF MOTION AND TELECONFERENCE WITH G. COE AT BOISE SCHILLER REGARDING SAME	FATELL	0.80
Nov 11 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH T. STEELE REGARDING GRAY LITIGATION IN FLORIDA	FATELL	1.00
Nov 11 09	CONFERENCE WITH B. FATELL REGARDING GRAY OBJECTION, INCLUDING CONFERENCES WITH BOIES AND STEELE (1.0); REVIEW PLEADINGS AND RELATED DOCUMENTS REGARDING GRAY MOTION	TARR	1.30
Nov 12 09	MULTIPLE EMAILS AND SCAN DOCUMENTS REGARDING GRAY STAY RELIEF MOTION	FATELL	0.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
Nov 12 09	EMAIL T. STEELE REGARDING CORRESPONDENCE	FATELL	0.10
Nov 12 09	REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS AND PLEADINGS RELATED TO GRAY LITIGATION	FATELL	1.20
Nov 12 09	FURTHER REVIEW GRAY PLEADINGS AND DISCUSS OBJECTION WITH S. TARR	FATELL	0.80
Nov 12 09	EMAILS REGARDING GRAY ACTIONS ON FLORIDA LITIGATION	FATELL	0.20
Nov 12 09	DRAFT OBJECTION TO GRAY LIFT STAY MOTION, INCLUDING REVIEW OF PLEADINGS IN CONNECTION THEREWITH AND CONFERENCES WITH BOIES AND B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	6.30
Nov 13 09	REVIEW AND REVISE OBJECTION TO STAY RELIEF	FATELL	1.00
Nov 13 09	FURTHER REVISE OBJECTION, DISCUSS CHANGES WITH S. TARR AND WITH G. COE AND FINALIZE OBJECTION AND FACILITATE FILING AND SERVICE	FATELL	3.80
Nov 13 09	REVISE GRAY OBJECTION AND ATTEND TO FILING OF SAME	TARR	2.70
Nov 17 09	REVIEW AND ANALYSIS OF GRAY RESPONSE, REVIEW BSF EMAIL REGARDING SAME AND CONFER WITH B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	1.00
Nov 18 09	REVIEW GRAY REPLY TO TRUSTEE'S OBJECTION	FATELL	0.30
Nov 18 09	M. SOMMER REGARDING GRAY LITIGATION	FATELL	0.60
Nov 18 09	EMAILS WITH BSF, B. FATELL AND SCHEDULE CONFERENCE CALL REGARDING PREP CALL	TARR	0.40
Nov 19 09	PREPARE FOR CONTESTED HEARING ON GRAY STAY RELIEF MOTION	FATELL	4.20
Nov 19 09	RESEARCH ISSUES AND ASSIST B. FATELL IN PREPARATION FOR GRAY ARGUMENT (2.0); REVIEW MULTIPLE EMAILS WITH BSF, CLIENT REGARDING SAME (0.3)	TARR	2.30
Nov 20 09	CONFERENCE WITH G. COE AND S. TARR TO PREPARE FOR CONTESTED STAY RELIEF HEARING	FATELL	0.80
Nov 20 09	PREPARE FOR 11/20 HEARING AND ATTEND SAME	TARR	3.00
Nov 20 09	DRAFT PROPOSED GRAY ORDERS	TARR	0.60
Nov 24 09	REVIEW 11TH CIR. STAY ORDER AND CONFER WITH BSF, B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (0.4); REVIEW	TARR	1.10

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
	PRIOR SUSE ARBITRATION STAY PLEADINGS AND EMAIL B. FATELL REGARDING SAME (0.7)		
Nov 25 09	EMAILS REGARDING COURT RULING ON GRAY STAY RELIEF MOTION	FATELL	0.20
Nov 25 09	FURTHER DISCUSSIONS WITH M. POLLACK REGARDING LEASE	FATELL	0.30
Nov 25 09	REVI EW GRAY LIFT STAY DENIAL AND CONFER WITH BSF, B. FATELL REGARDING SAME	TARR	0.50
Nov 30 09	REVIEW PORTION OF HEARING TRANSCRIPT	FATELL	0.30
Nov 30 09	REVIEW COURT'S ORDER AND OPINION ON STAY RELIEF MOTION	FATELL	0.30
PROJECT CODE TOTALS 12	TOTAL VALUE:	\$21,442.50	39.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE
 Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 15			
Nov 16 09	EMAIL TRUSTEE REGARDING AGENDA FOR 11/20 HEARING	FATELL	0.10
Nov 17 09	REVIEW HEARING AGENDA AND STATUS OF ITEMS WITH S. TARR	FATELL	0.30
Nov 18 09	DISCUSS AGENDA WITH S. TARR	FATELL	0.10
Nov 18 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH TRUSTEE TO UPDATE ON HEARING AGENDA FOR 11/20	FATELL	0.20
Nov 18 09	PREPARE, REVISE, FINALIZE, SCAN, EFILE AND COORDINATE SERVICE AND HAND DELIVERY TO CHAMBERS REGARDING 11/20/09 HEARING NOTEBOOKS AND AGENDA	MOODY	2.00
Nov 19 09	DISCUSS HEARING ISSUES WITH S. TARR	FATELL	0.20
Nov 19 09	ARRANGE TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE FOR G. COE OF BOIES, SCHILLER AND FLEXNER FOR 11/20/09 HEARING	MOODY	0.40
Nov 19 09	PREPARE 11/20/09 HEARING NOTEBOOK FOR B. FATELL AND S. TARR	MOODY	1.00
Nov 20 09	REPORT TO TRUSTEE CAHN ON HEARING	FATELL	0.30
Nov 20 09	TELECONFERENCE WITH R. TIBBITTS REGARDING HEARING AND GRAY CLAIMS	FATELL	0.30
Nov 20 09	PREPARE FOR HEARING	FATELL	3.80
Nov 20 09	ATTEND HEARING ON AUTO ZONE SETTLEMENT, BERGER SINGEMAN FEES, BOISE SCHILLER RETENTION AND GRAY'S STAY RELIEF MOTION	FATELL	2.10
Nov 20 09	ARRANGE TELEPHONIC APPEARANCE FOR D. STEWART AT ALSTON & BIRD LLP FOR THE 11/20/09 HEARING	MOODY	0.30
Nov 20 09	DOWNLOAD CONFIDENTIAL SETTLEMENT AGREEMENT (EXECUTED) WITH AUTOZONE .2; COORDINATE HAND DELIVERY TO S. TARR AT THE 11/20/09 HEARING .1	MOODY	0.30
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	15	TOTAL VALUE:	\$5,835.00
			11.40

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
PROJECT CODE: 16			
Nov 10 09	TRAVEL TO PHILADELPHIA FOR CLIENT MEETING (NON-WORKING BILLED AT 50%)	FATELL	0.50
Nov 10 09	TRAVEL TO AND FROM PHILLY FOR IBM/NOVELL STRATEGY MEETING	TARR	2.00
PROJECT CODE TOTALS	16	TOTAL VALUE:	\$1,157.50
			2.50

Client Number/Name: 133091 CAHN, EDWARD N., CHAPTER 11 TRUSTEE

Matter Number/Name: 133091-01600 IN re THE SCO GROUP, INC.

DATE	NARRATIVE	TIMEKEEPER	HOURS
REPORT TOTALS		TOTAL VALUE:	132,602.50 249.60